
The Great War: End of Ottoman Longevity and
Incidental Nations
The Great War, also known as World War I, was a global conflict that lasted from
1914 to 1918. It brought about significant changes on a global scale, reshaping
political boundaries and marking the end of the Ottoman Empire. This article
delves into the impact of the war on Ottoman longevity, as well as the emergence
of incidental nations during this tumultuous period.

The Ottoman Empire: A Historical Powerhouse

The Ottoman Empire, at its peak, was a powerful state that spanned three
continents: Europe, Asia, and Africa. It had a rich history, marked by military
conquests, religious tolerance, and cultural advancements. For centuries, the
empire enjoyed relative stability and longevity.

However, as the 19th century progressed, the empire began to face several
internal and external challenges. Socioeconomic problems, bureaucratic
inefficiencies, and nationalism movements within its territories weakened the
Ottoman grip. The empire was also exposed to the influence and demands of
European powers.
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The Great War: Catalyst for Change

The outbreak of the Great War had significant ramifications for the Ottoman
Empire. Initially, the empire sought to maintain a neutral stance but eventually
joined the Central Powers in hopes of expanding its territories and regaining lost
prestige.

The war, however, proved to be debilitating for the Ottoman Empire on multiple
fronts. It faced military setbacks, including defeat at the hands of British forces in
the Mesopotamian campaign. The empire also experienced economic strain and
massive population displacements due to the conflict.

Furthermore, the war provided fertile ground for nationalist movements to gain
traction within the Ottoman territories. Arab nationalism, Armenian nationalism,
and Kurdish nationalism were among the many movements that capitalized on
the empire's vulnerability and hoped to establish independent states.

The Emergence of Incidental Nations

The Great War served as a catalyst for the emergence of incidental nations,
those born out of the dissolution of empires or the redrawing of borders. The
defeat of the Ottoman Empire and subsequent dismantling resulted in the
creation of new nation-states in the Middle East and the Balkans.
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One notable example is the establishment of modern-day Turkey after the
collapse of the Ottoman Empire. Mustafa Kemal Atatürk, a military officer, led the
Turkish War of Independence and founded the Republic of Turkey in 1923. This
marked the end of the Ottoman era and the birth of a new nation.

The war also played a pivotal role in the formation of other countries. The Arab
Revolt, supported by the British, sought to establish an independent Arab state
encompassing most of the Arab territories under Ottoman rule. While the goal
was not fully realized, the war laid the groundwork for the later establishment of
various Arab nations, including Jordan, Iraq, and Syria.

Similarly, the Armenian Genocide and the subsequent collapse of the Ottoman
Empire contributed to the emergence of the Republic of Armenia in 1918. This
event was a defining moment in Armenian history and led to the establishment of
an independent Armenian state.

Legacy of the Great War

The Great War left a lasting impact on the world and fundamentally altered the
geopolitical landscape. The collapse of the Ottoman Empire, once a mighty force,
reshaped the Middle East and led to the creation of new nations.

Moreover, the war's aftermath saw significant changes in international relations
and the birth of various diplomatic mechanisms. The League of Nations, a
precursor to the United Nations, was established to prevent future conflicts and
maintain global peace.

, the Great War marked the end of Ottoman longevity and the rise of incidental
nations. It brought about the downfall of an empire that had dominated for
centuries, leading to the emergence of new countries in the Middle East and the



Balkans. The war's legacy continues to shape our world to this day, reminding us
of the profound impact that global conflicts can have on nations and societies.
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Imperial Resilience tells the story of the enduring Ottoman landscape of the
modern Middle East's formative years from the end of the First World War in 1918
to the of the peace settlement for the empire in 1923. Hasan Kayali moves
beyond both the well-known role that the First World War's victors played in
reshaping the region's map and institutions and the strains of ethnonationalism in
the empire's "Long War." Instead, Kayali crucially uncovers local actors' searches
for geopolitical solutions and concomitant collective identities based on Islamic
commonality. Instead of the certainties of the nation-states that emerged in the
wake of the belated peace treaty of 1923, we see how the Ottoman Empire
remained central in the mindset of leaders and popular groups, with long-lasting
consequences. 
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