
10 Lovely Throws To Make While Learning To
Use Chart
Learning to use charts can be an exciting and rewarding journey. As you dive into
the world of data visualization, there are numerous techniques and tools to
explore. One way to enhance your charting skills is by creating lovely throws or
blankets that depict your data in a visually appealing manner. In this article, we
will explore ten beautiful throws that you can make while mastering the art of
charting.

1. The Bar Chart Blanket

This throw is inspired by bar charts, one of the most common types of charts
used to display categorical data. Crochet or knit different colored squares to
represent the bars and arrange them in a way that mimics the structure of a bar
chart. This visually striking blanket is sure to catch everyone's attention!

2. The Line Chart Afghan

A line chart shows the trend or change in data over time. To create a line chart
afghan, use different shades of yarn to crochet or knit rows that represent the
data points. By arranging the rows in a sequential pattern, you can showcase a
beautiful line chart that feels cozy and warm.
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3. The Pie Chart Patchwork

Pie charts are great for displaying proportions or percentages. Create individual
circular patches using different fabrics or crochet pieces and combine them to
form a stunning pie chart. This unique throw will not only keep you warm but also
serve as an excellent conversation starter.

4. The Area Chart Quilt

An area chart is an ideal choice to show the cumulative effect of data over time.
For this throw, use different fabrics in varying shades to represent the stacked
areas of the chart. By sewing these fabrics together in a quilt pattern, you can
create a beautiful area chart quilt that doubles as a cozy blanket.

5. The Scatter Plot Tapestry

Scatter plots are used to display relationships between two variables. By
selecting different yarn colors or materials that represent the data points, you can
create a captivating scatter plot tapestry. The varying textures and colors will
make this throw a true work of art.

6. The Histogram Patchblanket

Histograms are excellent for visualizing the distribution of data. Crochet or knit
squares using different colored yarns to represent the bars of the histogram,
ensuring the width of each square matches its corresponding data interval.
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Combine these squares to form a cozy patchblanket that showcases the
distribution in a stylish way.

7. The Box Plot Pillow

Box plots are used to represent the distribution of a dataset. Create a pillow cover
featuring different geometric shapes and colors that represent the different
elements of a box plot. This unique pillow will not only provide comfort but also
serve as a reminder of your newfound charting skills.

8. The Bubble Chart Afghan

Bubble charts display data with three dimensions, using varying sizes and colors
to represent different data points. To make a bubble chart afghan, crochet or knit
circles of different sizes and colors, arranging them in a visually appealing
manner. This throw will not only keep you warm but also serve as a fun and eye-
catching decorative piece.

9. The Radar Chart Rug

Radar charts are used to compare multiple variables on different axes. Create a
rug that features different geometric shapes and colors, representing the various
elements of a radar chart. This visually stunning rug will add a touch of elegance
to any room while also reminding you of your charting expertise.

10. The Heatmap Blanket

Heatmaps are used to display data values using different color intensities.
Crochet or knit alternating rows of different colors, each representing a different
data value or range. By combining these rows, you can create a cozy and visually
striking heatmap blanket that will impress everyone who sees it.



As you embark on the journey of learning to use charts, these lovely throws and
blankets will keep you motivated and inspired. Not only will they add warmth and
beauty to your surroundings, but they will also remind you of the power of data
visualization. So grab your yarn, needles, and charts, and start creating these
stunning pieces that blend creativity and analytics!
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Filet crochet isn’t just for doilies anymore! These eight charted designs for
afghans finish quickly, with pretty images of birds in flight, easy geometrics, a
delicate butterfly, or Art Deco florals. You’ll race through the rows of simple
stitches, adding the lacy look of filet crochet to your home in a bold new way -
with an afghan for every room! 8 Designs by Michele Mireau to crochet using
medium weight yarn: Mulberry Ripple, Blue Seagull Fantasy, Blueberry
Diamonds, Lilac Mosaic, Peach Opposites Attract, Pink Butterfly, Grey Simply
Squares, and Yellow Springtime. Each design is worked by following a square-
grid chart, where open squares represent working “ch 1, dc” and colored squares
indicate “2 dc.”
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